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The Australian government has two 
systems for refugee arrivals. One is 

the official refugee resettlement system, a 
coordinated approach between Australia 
and the United Nations High Commission 
for Refugees (UNHCR), and the other is 
the government’s response to informal or 
irregular arrivals of people seeking asylum, 
particularly those arriving by boat. Over the 
past 20 years, people who arrive informally 
have been placed in immigration detention, 
deported, or given temporary forms of ref-
ugee protection. Within this system some 
people are stateless, with no country to 
return to and no citizenship or nationality 
to protect them. Within the existing body of 
knowledge relating to statelessness, there is 
limited literature relating to the lived expe-
rience of statelessness and the experience of 
the stateless refugee in democratic countries 
that adhere to international human rights 
norms. Furthermore, there is only limited 
research on the Rohingya, a well-known 
stateless refugee community, in contexts 
outside of Myanmar and Bangladesh. To 
address these knowledge gaps, the research 
described in this thesis draws on the lived 
experiences of the stateless Rohingya refu-
gees in Sydney, Australia, to explore the 
intersection of statelessness and temporary 
forms of refugee protection. More specifi-
cally, this thesis focuses on four areas of 

research: 1) Developing an understanding 
of statelessness from the perspective of the 
Rohingya, how statelessness changes in 
different contexts, and how statelessness 
affects individuals, families, and groups; 2) 
Investigating the ways in which temporary 
forms of refugee protection create barriers 
to building a new life in accordance with 
a human-rights approach. Comparison is 
made between temporary and permanent 
settlement experiences; 3) Examining the 
intersection of statelessness and prolonged 
temporariness and analysing their impact 
on the Rohingya; 4) Exploring the ways in 
which notions of belonging and community 
are created within the context of prolonged 
temporariness and persistent statelessness.

Methodologies described in this thesis 
include phenomenology and anti-oppres-
sive social work methodologies combined 
with participatory action research methods. 
Using this combined approach, members 
of the Rohingya community in Sydney 
engaged with this research in discussion 
through a collaborative partnership. Rep-
resentatives from the Rohingya community 
were involved in developing the focus and 
design of the research project, as well as co-
ordinating and co-facilitating of the field-
work. A total of 63 participants from the 
Rohingya community shared aspects of their 
lived experiences through in-depth inter-
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views and focus groups meetings between 
November 2020 and December 2021.

The key finding of this research is that 
statelessness dominates and dictates all 
aspects of life and inevitably permeates a 
person’s sense of identity and self-worth, 
their choices, and perspectives. From a 
human-rights perspective, statelessness 
manifests as a form of internalised oppres-
sion, described by research participants as 

“Rohingya Life.” This research also found that 
prolonged temporariness places people in a 
transitional or “liminal” state, which, com-
bined with structural barriers, affects their 
interaction with time and mental health and 
challenges their sense of belonging. A key 
contribution of this research is the develop-
ment of a new conceptual model that pro-
vides a structural analysis of statelessness 
and prolonged temporariness at the micro 
(personal), meso (community) and macro 
(structural) levels of society. The proposed 
model contributes to a better understand-
ing of how statelessness intersects with Aus-
tralia’s temporary refugee protection system 
and enhances understanding of the lived 
experience of statelessness.
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